

LOGAN CITY

Bid Opening 11:00 a.m., October 10, 2016 - City Hall Conference Room

PW Building Re-Roof Project

Company Name	Bid Bond	Qual Form	Schedule	Addenda	Base Bid	Add Alternate	Total
All Weather Water Proofing					No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
American Roofing	x	x	x	x	80,620.00	184,000.00	264,620.00
Clark's Quality Roofing	x	x	x	x	68,500.00	128,500.00	197,000.00
Collins Roofing, Inc.	x	x	x	x	78,253.00	114,549.00	192,802.00
Island Heights Construction	x	x	x	x	63,450.00	151,550.00	215,000.00
Noorda BEC	x	x	x	x	77,259.00	170,654.00	247,913.00

Awarded to Collins Roofing, Inc. 10/20/16

SOCC Building Re-Roof Project

Company Name	Bid Bond	Qual Form	Schedule	Addenda	Base Bid	Add Alternate	Total
All Weather Water Proofing					No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
American Roofing	x	x	x	x	126,570.00	65.00	126,635.00
Clark's Quality Roofing	x	x	x	x	88,800.00	132.00	88,932.00
Collins Roofing Inc.	x	x	x	x	120,959.00	250.00	121,209.00
Island Heights Construction	x	x	x	x	115,000.00	N/C	115,000.00
Noorda BEC	x	x	x	x	96,480.00	80.96	96,560.96

Awarded to Clark's Quality Roofing 10/19/16